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What Greg's clients have to say

Jun 2025

Greg is very thorough and responsive.

Feb 2025

It is very straightforward, I get sent the
documents to review and accept

Greg began his insurance career
in 1980 and joined Rothbury in
2024 through the acquisition of
Austinsure. Specialising in clients
such as Valuers, Lawyers, RANZ
Members, Aircraft Owners,
Architects, and Aviation & Fire &
General clients, Greg brings a
wealth of industry experience.
His strengths in relationship
management, prioritising, and
customer service allow him to
build lasting rapport and trust
with clients.

Outside of work, Greg enjoys
time with family and friends,
fishing, watching sports, and
working on woodwork projects in
his workshop. He appreciates
Auckland for keeping him close
to family and friends.

© Copyright Rothbury Insurance Brokers 2025

mailto:greg.boult@rothbury.co.nz

